
 
CERNER OVERVIEW:  

 

Cerner is transforming health care by eliminating error, variance and waste for health care 
providers and consumers around the world. Our solutions optimize processes for health 
care organizations ranging from single-doctor practices to entire countries, for the 
pharmaceutical and medical device industries, and for the field of health care as a whole. 
Our solutions are licensed by more than 9,000 facilities worldwide. 

Health care is too important to stay the same! 

We invite you to join us in our quest to make health care become all it should be. Since our 
company began, we have been committed to transformational change in the vital task of 
keeping people well. Now more than ever, our focus is on developing the innovations that 
will help improve the entire health care system. Ultimately, as our CEO Neal Patterson has 
said, health care is personal. Because in the end, nothing matters more than our health 
and our families. 

 

 
 
Velocity Analyst  
 

 

Program Overview: 

Cerner invests heavily in training and developing associates. The Velocity Analyst training 
program includes training focused on improving business effectiveness through analysis, 
forecasting, and measurement to ultimately impact Cerner's business practices and 
processes. 

Responsibilities: 

Cerner's Velocity Analysts are analytical, flexible individuals determined to gain experience 
while playing a key role in changing healthcare. They take on challenging assignments 
early in their career with an aim to develop and sustain an exciting career trajectory. This 
could include realignment to the Velocity Delivery Consultant program or opportunities 
within Cerner's business operations and support organizations. Placements are determined 
by training scores, aptitudes, business need, and the individual associate's long term 
career goals. 

Requirements: 

 Minimum 3.0 Cumulative GPA  

 0 - 4 years relevant work experience post-graduation 

 U.S. Work Authorization Required  

 Interest and/or experience in healthcare industry preferred  

 Relocation to Cerner's World Headquarters in the Kansas City metropolitan area  

 Ability to travel is a plus  

Must meet the following education requirement: 

 Bachelor's Degree from an accredited institution with a completed major in 
Business, Science, Health, or Engineering related program  

*Applicants for U.S.-based positions with Cerner Corporation must be legally authorized to 
work in the United States. Verification of employment eligibility will be required at the time 
of hire. Visa sponsorship is not available for this position.  

*Cerner Corporation is proud to be an Equal Opportunity Employer and a drug-free 
workplace. 

  



 
Velocity Software Engineer 

 

Program Overview: 

The Velocity Software Engineer Training Program is designed to help new associates 
develop the skills and capabilities necessary to be successful Software Engineers. During 
training associates will gain an understanding of Cerner technologies and gain exposure to 
tools that will allow them to be instrumental in the development and support of Cerner's 
leading edge clinical and management information systems. 

Responsibilities: 

Cerner's Velocity Software Engineers are responsible for fully understanding user 
requirements, providing input to functional design, developing applications, testing, and 
troubleshooting across Cerner's entire family of solutions. To accomplish their work, they 
use a variety of languages, including (but not limited to) Java, C#, C++, Visual C++, Visual 
Basic, JavaScript, .Net, HTML, SQL using Oracle. 

Requirements: 

 Bachelor's Degree from an accredited institution  

 Proficient programming knowledge  

 Minimum 2.8 Cumulative GPA  

 Relocation to Cerner's World Headquarters in the Kansas City metropolitan area  

 Interest and/or experience in the healthcare industry preferred  

 
*Applicants for U.S.-based positions with Cerner Corporation must be legally authorized to 
work in the United States. Verification of employment eligibility will be required at the time 
of hire. 

*Cerner Corporation is proud to be an Equal Opportunity Employer and a drug-free 
workplace. 

  

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Velocity System Engineer  

 

Program Overview: 

The Velocity System Engineer/Consultant Training Program is designed to help new 
associates develop the skills and capabilities necessary to be successful System 
Engineers. During training associates will gain an understanding of Cerner technologies 
and will learn the fundamental components of configuring systems and software. 

Responsibilities: 

Velocity System Engineers/Consultants design, install, implement, and provide technical 
support for Cerner application software. They consult with clients, analyze requirements, 
design system information flow, implement processes, install and support Cerner and third-
party licensed software (IBM, HP, ORACLE, and others) and configure systems and 
application software for optimal performance, recoverability, and availability. 

Cerner's Velocity System Engineers/Consultants are able to demonstrate strong technical 
skills to identify problems and provide workable solutions, follow processes, provide 
documentation, and communicate with clients effectively and in a timely manner. They may 
also be responsible for the design and implementation of data interfaces with non-Cerner 
information systems. 

Requirements: 

 Bachelor's Degree from an accredited institution  

 Proficient programming knowledge  

 Minimum 2.8 Cumulative GPA  

 U.S. Work Authorization Required  

 Interest and/or experience in the healthcare industry preferred  

 Relocation to Cerner's World Headquarters in the Kansas City metropolitan area  

*Applicants for U.S.-based positions with Cerner Corporation must be legally authorized to 
work in the United States. Verification of employment eligibility will be required at the time 
of hire. Visa sponsorship is not available for this position.  

*Cerner Corporation is proud to be an Equal Opportunity Employer and a drug-free 
workplace. 

  

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Velocity Professional Services Consultant  

 

Program Overview: 

The Velocity Professional Services Consultant (PSC) training program is designed to help 
new associates develop the skills and capabilities necessary to be successful Cerner 
Consultants. During Consultant training associates will gain an understanding of Cerner 
solutions and will learn the fundamental components of solution build, maintenance and 
testing.  

Responsibilities: 

PSCs are responsible for creating and maintaining professional relationships at the 
appropriate level between the Client and the Cerner project team members and effectively 
communicating status updates and project plans. PSCs spend a significant amount of time 
in a technical capacity, using Microsoft suite applications, designing and customizing the 
solution based on the Client's requirements. This is accomplished through assisting clients 
in implementing Cerner Solutions with a repeatable, practicable methodology bringing 
speed to value results. They often work side by side with clients on-site and may be 
required to travel to their client's location. 

Upon satisfactory completion of training, Velocity Professional Services Consultants are 
typically placed in a professional services organization based upon business need. 

Minimum Qualifications: 

 U.S. Work Authorization Required  

 Ability to travel up to 20-80% 

 0-4 years relevant work experience post-graduation   

 Relocation to Cerner's World Headquarters in the Kansas City metropolitan area  

 Interest and/or experience in the healthcare industry preferred  

 Educational background in Business, Technology, or Healthcare field preferred  

Must meet at least one of the following education requirements: 

1. 3.0 or higher cumulative GPA and Bachelor's Degree from an accredited 
institution  

2. 2.8 or higher cumulative GPA and Bachelor's Degree from an accredited 
institution with 1 or more years of professional and applicable experience  

*Applicants for U.S.-based positions with Cerner Corporation must be legally authorized to 
work in the United States. Verification of employment eligibility will be required at the time 
of hire. Visa sponsorship is not available for this position.  

*Cerner Corporation is proud to be an Equal Opportunity Employer and a drug-free 
workplace. 

  

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Velocity Application Services Consultant  

 

Program Overview: 

The Velocity Application Services Consultant (ASC) training program is designed to help 
new associates develop the skills and capabilities necessary to be successful Cerner 
Consultants. During Consultant training associates will gain an understanding of Cerner 
solutions and will learn the fundamental components of solution build, maintenance and 
testing.  

Responsibilities: 

ASCs are primarily responsible for creating and maintaining professional relationships at 
the appropriate level between the Client and the Cerner project team members and 
effectively communicating status updates and project plans. They do this by understanding 
client work flows, designing test scripts to test for functionality after a code upgrade, 
testing, troubleshooting, issue management, defect tracking, client training, and go-live 
support. ASCs accomplish most of their deliverables by working with remote clients and 
participating in collaborative events in Kansas City. The position requires little to no travel. 

Upon satisfactory completion of training, Velocity Application Services Consultants are 
typically placed in a Managed Services or Application Services organization based upon 
business need.  

Minimum Qualifications: 

 U.S. Work Authorization Required  

 Ability to travel up to 0-20% 

 0- 4 years relevant work experience post-graduation  

 Relocation to Cerner's World Headquarters in the Kansas City metropolitan area  

 Interest and/or experience in the healthcare industry preferred  

 Educational background in Business, Technology, or Healthcare field preferred  

Must meet at least one of the following education requirements 

1. 3.0 or higher cumulative GPA and Bachelor's Degree from an accredited 
institution  

2. 2.8 or higher cumulative GPA and Bachelor's Degree from an accredited 
institution with 1 or more years of professional and applicable experience  

*Applicants for U.S.-based positions with Cerner Corporation must be legally authorized to 
work in the United States. Verification of employment eligibility will be required at the time 
of hire. Visa sponsorship is not available for this position.  
 
*Cerner Corporation is proud to be an Equal Opportunity Employer and a drug-free 
workplace. 

  

 


